BID TABULATION

Bid #:
 IFB14-2780A

Due Date:   September 6, 2013
 

Agency:  Department of Administration, General Services Division, State Procurement Bureau

Contracts Officer:  Jeannie Lake

Note:  Product details will be provided in resulting contracts.

	VENDOR
	LINE 1
	LINE 2
	LINE 3
	LINE 4
	LINE 5
	LINE 6

	Adamson Police Products
	Brand: Winchester
	Brand: Winchester
	Brand: Winchester
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: Winchester
	Brand: Winchester

	
	Cost: $468.00
	Cost: $483.00
	Cost: $322.00
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $381.00
	Cost: $670.00

	Kesselring Gun Shop, Inc.
	Brand: Hornady
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: Hornady
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: Hornady
	Brand: Hornady

	
	Cost: $570.00
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $379.00
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $420.00
	Cost: $539.00

	Proforce Law Enforcement


	Brand:  Remington
	Brand: Remington
	Brand: Remington
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: Remington
	Brand: No Bid

	
	Cost: $382.80
	Cost: $449.46
	Cost $347.31
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $303.23
	Cost: $0.00

	Salt Lake Wholesale Sports
	Brand: Hornady
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: Hornday
	Brand: Hornday
	Brand: Hornday
	Brand: Hornday

	
	Cost: $724.43
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $509.80
	Cost: $478.37
	Cost: $577.83
	Cost: $998.85


	VENDOR
	LINE 7
	LINE 8
	LINE 9
	LINE 10
	LINE 11
	LINE 12

	Adamson Police Products
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: Winchester
	Brand: Winchester
	Brand: Winchester
	Brand: Winchester
	Brand: Winchester

	
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $670.00
	Cost: $483.00
	Cost: $670.00
	Cost: $523.00
	Cost: $351.00

	Kesselring Gun Shop, Inc.
	Brand: Hornady
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: Hornady
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: Hornady

	
	Cost: $435.00
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $539.00
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $387.00

	Proforce Law Enforcement
	Brand: Remington
	Brand: Remington
	Brand: Remington
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: Remington
	Brand: Remington

	
	Cost: $343.01
	Cost: $259.14
	Cost: $449.46
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $312.90
	Cost: $368.82

	Salt Lake Wholesale Sports
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: Hornady
	Brand: Hornday
	Brand: Hornday

	
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $998.85
	Cost: $560.25
	Cost: $531.00


	VENDOR
	LINE 13
	LINE 14
	LINE 15
	LINE 16
	LINE 17
	LINE 18

	Adamson Police Products
	Brand: Winchester
	Brand: Winchester
	Brand: Winchester
	Brand: Winchester
	Brand: Winchester
	Brand: Winchester

	
	Cost: $824.00
	Cost: $470.00
	Cost: $468.00
	Cost: $483.00
	Cost: $381.00
	Cost: $670.00

	Kesselring Gun Shop, Inc.
	Brand: Hornady
	Brand: Hornady
	Brand: Hornady
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: Hornady
	Brand: Hornady

	
	Cost: $850.00
	Cost: $526.87
	Cost: $870.00
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: 420.00
	Cost: $539.00

	Proforce Law Enforcement
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: Remington
	Brand: Remington
	Brand: Remington
	Brand: Remington
	Brand: No Bid

	
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $468.00
	Cost: $382.80
	Cost: $449.46
	Cost: $303.23
	Cost: $0.00

	Salt Lake Wholesale Sports
	Brand: Hornday
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: Hornday
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: Hornday
	Brand: Hornday

	
	Cost: $1,168.91
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $724.43
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $577.83
	Cost: $998.85


	VENDOR
	LINE 19
	LINE 20
	LINE 21
	LINE 22
	LINE 23
	LINE 24

	Adamson Police Products
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: Winchester
	Brand: Winchester
	Brand: Winchester

	
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $354.00
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $428.00
	Cost: $483.00
	Cost: $322.00

	Kesselring Gun Shop, Inc.
	Brand: Hornady
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: Hornady
	Brand: Hornady
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: Hornady

	
	Cost: $435.00
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $850.00
	Cost: $526.87
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $371.00

	Proforce Law Enforcement
	Brand: Remington
	Brand: Remington
	Brand: Remington
	Brand: Remington
	Brand: Remington
	Brand: Remington

	
	Cost: $343.01
	Cost: $259.14
	Cost: $343.01
	Cost: $876.34
	Cost: $464.52
	Cost: $449.46

	Salt Lake Wholesale Sports
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: Hornday
	Brand: Hornday
	Brand: No Bid
	Brand: Hornday

	
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $1,168.91
	Cost: $724.43
	Cost: $0.00
	Cost: $509.80


