BID TABULATION

Bid #:
IFB15-3167A
Due Date: March 2, 2015
Agency:  Department of Administration


Contracts Officer:  Jeannie Lake
 
Aircraft Maintenance
Line # 1 - Helicopters
	Vendor
	Standard and 
scheduled inspections, maintenance and repairs
	After Hours Emergency Shop Rate
	Discount from Retail Pricing for Parts

	Holman Enterprises/Glacier Jet Center
	$ 70.00 per hour
	$ 85.00 per hour
	2.5%

	Exec Air Montana, Inc.
	$ 90.00 per hour
	$ 120.00 per hour
	10%

	Advanced Helicopter Services
	$ 95.00 per hour
	$ 115.00 per hour
	5% Did not provide required documents – non responsive

	Lynch Flying Service, Inc./Edwards Jet Center
	No Bid
	No Bid
	-

	Neptune Aviation Services
	No Bid
	No Bid
	-


Line # 2 – Fixed Wing
	Vendor
	Standard and 
scheduled inspections, maintenance and repairs
	After Hours Emergency Shop Rate
	Discount from Retail Pricing for Parts

	Holman Enterprises/Glacier Jet Center
	$ 60.00 per hour
	$ 75.00 per hour
	2.5%

	Exec Air Montana, Inc.
	$ 70.00 per hour
	$ 120.00 per hour
	10%

	Lynch Flying Service, Inc./Edwards Jet Center
	$ 75.00 per hour
	$ 75.00 per hour
	5%

	Neptune Aviation Services
	$ 78.00 per hour
	$ 117.00 per hour
	None listed

	Advanced Helicopter Services
	No Bid
	No Bid
	-


Line # 3 – Governor’s King Air C-90
	Vendor
	Standard and 
scheduled inspections, maintenance and repairs
	After Hours Emergency Shop Rate
	Discount from Retail Pricing for Parts

	Holman Enterprises/Glacier Jet Center
	$ 70.00 per hour
	$ 85.00 per hour
	2.5%

	Exec Air Montana, Inc.
	$ 80.00 per hour
	$ 120.00 per hour
	10%

	Lynch Flying Service, Inc./Edwards Jet Center
	$ 82.00 per hour
	$ 82.00 per hour
	5%

	Neptune Aviation Services
	$ 85.00 per hour
	$ 127.50 per hour
	None listed

	Advanced Helicopter Services
	No Bid
	No Bid
	-


