SPB14-2333J

Shredding Services – Statewide

Bidtab


	Service Location
	Cities Included
	Container size
	Quantity
	Price per each container
	Price per each container
	Price per each container

	
	
	
	
	Document Destroyers
	Montana Records Management
	Recall SDS

	Glacier (Northwest)
	Kalispell, Libby, Missoula
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	32 gallon
	1-5
	$   No Bid
	$ 13.00
	$   7.00

	
	
	32 gallon
	6 or >
	$   No Bid
	$ 13.00
	$   7.00

	
	
	64 gallon
	1-5
	$   No Bid
	$ 21.20
	$ 11.00

	
	
	64 gallon
	6 or >
	$   No Bid
	$ 18.50
	$ 11.00

	TOTAL OVERALL COST:
	$   No Bid
	$ 66.00
	$ 36.00

	Gold West (Southwest)
	Butte, Dillon
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	32 gallon
	1-5
	$   No Bid
	$ 11.00
	$   7.00

	
	
	32 gallon
	6 or >
	$   No Bid
	$ 11.00
	$   7.00

	
	
	64 gallon
	1-5
	$   No Bid
	$ 19.50
	$ 11.00

	
	
	64 gallon
	6 or >
	$   No Bid
	$ 16.50
	$ 11.00

	TOTAL OVERALL COST:
	$   No Bid
	$ 58.00
	$ 36.00

	Russell (North Central)
	Great Falls, Havre, Lewistown
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	32 gallon
	1-5
	$   No Bid
	$ 11.00
	$   7.00

	
	
	32 gallon
	6 or >
	$   No Bid
	$ 11.00
	$   7.00

	
	
	64 gallon
	1-5
	$   No Bid
	$ 19.50
	$ 11.00

	
	
	64 gallon
	6 or >
	$   No Bid
	$ 16.50
	$ 11.00

	TOTAL OVERALL COST:
	$   No Bid
	$ 58.00
	$ 36.00

	Yellowstone (South Central)
	Bozeman, Livingston
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	32 gallon
	1-5
	$ 13.00
	$ 11.00
	$   7.00

	
	
	32 gallon
	6 or >
	$ 12.00
	$ 11.00
	$   7.00

	
	
	64 gallon
	1-5
	$ 20.00
	$ 19.50
	$ 11.00

	
	
	64 gallon
	6 or >
	$ 19.00
	$ 16.50
	$ 11.00

	TOTAL OVERALL COST:
	$ 64.00
	$ 58.00
	$ 36.00

	Service Location
	Cities Included
	Container size
	Quantity
	Price per each container
	Price per each container
	Price per each container

	
	
	
	
	Document Destroyers
	Montana Records Management
	Recall SDS

	Missouri River (North East)
	Glasgow, Sidney, Wolf Point
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	32 gallon
	1-5
	$   No Bid
	$ 13.00
	$   7.00

	
	
	32 gallon
	6 or >
	$   No Bid
	$ 13.00
	$   7.00

	
	
	64 gallon
	1-5
	$   No Bid
	$ 21.50
	$ 11.00

	
	
	64 gallon
	6 or >
	$   No Bid
	$ 18.50
	$ 11.00

	TOTAL OVERALL COST:
	$   No Bid
	$ 66.00
	$ 36.00


	Custer (South East)
	Billings, Glendive, Miles City
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	32 gallon
	1-5
	$   No Bid
	$ 11.00
	$   7.00

	
	
	32 gallon
	6 or >
	$   No Bid
	$ 11.00
	$   7.00

	
	
	64 gallon
	1-5
	$   No Bid
	$ 19.50
	$ 11.00

	
	
	64 gallon
	6 or >
	$   No Bid
	$ 16.50
	$ 11.00

	TOTAL OVERALL COST:
	$   No Bid
	$ 58.00
	$ 36.00

	Capitol City
	Helena
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	32 gallon
	1-5
	$ 13.00
	$ 11.00
	$   7.00

	
	
	32 gallon
	6 or >
	$ 12.00
	$ 11.00
	$   7.00

	
	
	64 gallon
	1-5
	$ 20.00
	$ 19.50
	$ 11.00

	
	
	64 gallon
	6 or >
	$ 19.00
	$ 16.50
	$ 11.00

	TOTAL OVERALL COST:
	$ 64.00
	$ 58.00
	$ 36.00


1

