


Communications Wiring

Summary of Bids

IFB #:  B0003344

Due Date:  June 10, 2015

DESCRIPTION AND NUMBER

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

MANUFACTURER 

NUMBER

ESTIMATE 

USAGE

1 TE Non-Plenum Cat 6, 4 Pair, 24 awg cable, 1000 ft, Box-Gray 1000 ft -reelbox TE620R-GYRB 200 218.93     231.32        155.00        195.00       155.00      

2 TE Plenum Cat 6, 4 Pair, 24 awg cable, 1000 ft, Box-Gray 1000 ft – reelbox TE620P-GYRB 150 522.32     548.58        308.00        465.00       308.00      

3 Chatsworth Electronic Rack 7' x 19" - 46353-5-03 EACH 46353-5-03 5 248.40     262.64        240.00        no bid 240.00      

4 Chatsworth Double Verticle Cabling Section 11729-503 EACH 11729-5-03 5 364.94     383.87        335.00        no bid 335.00      

5 Chatsworth Wall Mount Rack - Bus Bar1-INX4IN – grounding bar EACH 10622-010 No estimate 103.51     117.60        106.00        no bid 103.51      

6 Chatsworth Wall Mount Rack - 19X24 5X12 CL EACH 11960-512 2 197.78     213.00        200.00        no bid 197.78      

7 Chatsworth Finger Snaps, 12 each bag EACH 12370-002 No estimate 126.30     139.00        126.00        no bid 126.00      

8 Chatsworth Cable Manager 12"x7' EACH 40100-703 No estimate 714.86     805.24        710.00        no bid 710.00      

9 Great Lakes Wall Mount Swing Lockable Cabinet-36x24.5x21.25 EACH GL36WM No estimate 676.39     712.56        610.00        639.75       610.00      

10 Great Lakes Wall Mount Swing Lockable Cabinet-48x24.5x21.25 EACH GL48WM No estimate 759.94     826.80        680.00        742.30       680.00      

11 Siemon Rear Wire Minder - WM-BK EACH WM-BK 50 20.13       22.44          18.95          no bid 18.95        

12 TE Wire Manager - 1U EACH 558329-1 20 35.33       35.08          29.50          35.00         29.50        

13 TE Wire Manager - 2U - 3.5" EACH 558331-1 50 40.76       40.47          34.00          39.75         34.00        

14 TE Cat 3 Telephone Patch Panel 2 Pair - 24 port EACH 557403-1 5 no bid 107.89        90.69          92.75         90.69        

15 TE Cat 6 Modular Jack - Almond EACH 1375055-1 1,000 7.77         7.57            5.95            6.35           5.95          

16 TE Cat 6 Modular Jack - Gray EACH 1375055-4 No estimate 7.77         8.24            5.95            6.35           5.95          

17 TE Cat 6 Modular Jack- White EACH 1375055-3 250 7.77         7.57            5.95            6.35           5.95          

18 TE Cat 6 Modular Jack- Blue EACH 1375055-6 No estimate 7.77         no bid 5.95            6.35           5.95          

19 Telephone Wall Jack - Ivory EACH IC630DB6 No estimate no bid no bid 2.20            no bid 2.20          

20 TE RJ 11 Insert - 555611-1 (10 per box) EACH 555611-1 No estimate no bid no bid 5.46            5.60           5.46          

21 TE RJ 11 Dual Insert - 555614-1 (10 per box) EACH 555614-1 No estimate no bid 9.21            6.90            7.05           6.90          

22 TE Cat 5 E Dual Insert - 557280-1 (10 per box) EACH 557280-1 50 no bid 8.70            7.30            7.45           7.30          

23 TE Cat 5 E Dual-RJ11 Insert - 557260-1 (10 per box) EACH 557260-1 No estimate no bid no bid 7.30            7.45           7.30          

24 TE Cat 6 Insert - 1644031-1 (T568A) EACH 1644031-1 50 no bid 6.50            5.50            5.58           5.50          

25 TE SL Series Blank insert - Almond EACH 1116412-1 No estimate no bid 0.29            0.22            0.23           0.22          

26 TE MJplug, 8P, Oval Awg 24-26 EACH 5-554720-3 200 no bid 0.31            0.26            0.26           0.26          TIE

27 TE 2 Port Single Gang Faceplate for 110 Jacks - Almond EACH 2111009-1 500 no bid 2.06            1.45            1.60           1.45          

28 TE 2 Port Single Gang Faceplate for 110 Jacks - White EACH 1-2111009-3 100 no bid 2.06            1.45            1.60           1.45          

29 TE Single Gang 6 Port Faceplate - Almond EACH 2111025-1 10 no bid 1.31            0.99            1.05           0.99          

30 TE Single Gang 4 Port Faceplate - White EACH 1-2111011-3 50 no bid 2.06            1.45            1.60           1.45          

31 TE Single Gang 4 Port Faceplate Almond EACH 2111011-1 150 no bid 2.06            1.45            1.60           1.45          

32 TE Standard Faceplate 4 port double gang - Almond EACH 83935-1 50 no bid 4.99            3.70            3.85           3.70          

33 TE Standard Faceplate 4 port double gang - White EACH 83935-3 20 no bid 4.99            3.70            3.85           3.70          

34 TE Faceplate 8 port double gang EACH 2111014-1 No estimate no bid 4.94            3.65            3.85           3.65          

35 Semtron Stainless Steel Faceplate 2 port single gang EACH 1FM-00E-AMP No estimate no bid no bid 3.30            4.65           3.30          

36 Semtron Stainless Steel Faceplate 4 port single gang EACH 1FM-(4)0E-AMP No estimate no bid no bid 3.98            4.65           3.98          

37 Semtron Stainless Steel Faceplate  4 port double gang EACH 2FM-(4)0E-AMP No estimate no bid no bid 7.00            7.25           7.00          

38 TE Cat 6 High Density 48 port patch panel unloaded EACH 1375015-2 30 350.57     352.58        275.00        296.50       275.00      

39 TE Cat 6 High Density 24 port patch panel unloaded EACH 1375014-2 10 175.69     178.93        140.00        151.00       140.00      

40 TE Cat 6 Patch Cord - Booted - Black - 1 foot EACH TCPC-6RUVB-BK-01F 200 no bid 6.59            5.45            5.60           5.45          

41 TE Cat 6 Patch Cord - Booted - Black - 3 feet EACH TCPC-6RUVB-BK-03F 300 no bid 7.21            5.96            6.20           5.96          

42 TE Cat 6 Patch Cord - Booted - Black - 5 feet EACH TCPC-6RUVB-BK-05F 300 no bid 7.84            6.45            6.75           6.45          

43 TE Cat 6 Patch Cord - Booted - Black - 7 feet EACH TCPC-6RUVB-BK-07F 300 no bid 7.26            7.00            7.30           7.00          

44 TE Cat 6 Patch Cord - Booted - Black - 10 feet EACH TCPC-6RUVB-BK-10F 500 no bid 8.09            7.80            8.10           7.80          

45 TE Cat 6 Patch Cord - Booted - Black - 14 feet EACH TCPC-6RUVB-BK-14F 80 no bid 10.62          8.90            9.20           8.90          

46 TE Cat 6 Patch Cord - Booted - Black - 16 feet EACH TCPC-6RUVB-BK-16F 60 no bid 11.24          9.30            9.65           9.30          

47 TE Cat 6 Patch Cord - Booted - Black - 20 feet EACH TCPC-6RUVB-BK-20F 60 no bid 12.48          10.30          10.75         10.30        

48 TE Cat 6 Patch Cord - Booted - Black - 25 feet EACH TCPC-6RUVB-BK-25F 80 no bid 11.90          11.25          12.10         11.25        

49 Siecor Fanout Kits f/12 fbrs EACH FAN-BT47-12 10 17.11       17.47          17.00          no bid 17.00        

50 Corning Fiber Panel Wall Mount - capable 4 connectors EACH WCH-04P No estimate 131.31     147.66        130.00        no bid 130.00      

51 Corning Fiber Panel Wall Mount - capable 6 connectors EACH WCH-06P No estimate 188.79     212.30        185.00        no bid 185.00      

52 Corning Fiber Panel Rack Mount - capable 4 connectors EACH CCH-02U 10 233.90     235.88        230.00        no bid 230.00      

53 TE RMG/AMP 4RU Fiber Panel Rack Mount - capable 12 connectors EACH RMG-4000-000B 2 no bid 300.73        250.00        260.00       250.00      

54 TE Fiber Snap-in Adapter Plate - LC/APC - 12 fibers EACH 1374463-6 20 91.89       88.91          74.00          76.50         74.00        

55 Corning Fiber Connector Panel - ST -CP06-25T MM EACH CCH-CP06-25T 25 55.81       55.91          56.00          no bid 55.81        

56 Corning Fiber Connector Panel - ST -CP12-25T MM EACH CCH-CP12-25T No estimate 99.74       110.18        98.00          no bid 98.00        

57 Corning Fiber Connector Panel - SC -CP06-38 SM EACH CCH-CP06-38 25 75.33       75.97          50.00          no bid 50.00        

58 Corning Fiber Unicam Connectors-ST Multi Mode 95-000-50 EACH 95-000-50 100 10.88       10.40          10.00          no bid 10.00        

59 Corning Fiber Unicam Connectors-SC Single Mode 95-200-41 EACH 95-200-41 100 15.92       15.65          15.00          no bid 15.00        

60 TE Fiber Splice Tray Assembly 12 strand EACH 559433-3 20 no bid 29.21          24.00          25.10         24.00        

61 Fiber Pigtail single mode SC multicolor 3 meter 6 pack EACH 10 no bid 72.12          32.00          45.00         32.00        

62 Fiber Pigtail single mode SC multicolor 3 meter 12 pack EACH 10 no bid 155.90        44.58          80.00         44.58        

63 Fiber Pigtail multi mode ST multicolor 3 meter 6 pack EACH 10 no bid 105.75        24.70          45.00         24.70        

64 Fiber Pigtail multi mode ST multicolor 3 meter 12 pack EACH 10 no bid 151.98        47.00          70.00         47.00        

65 Fiber Pigtail single mode LC/APC multicolor 3 meter 6 pack EACH 10 no bid 87.60          48.00          45.00         45.00        

66 Fiber Pigtail single mode LC/APC multicolor 3 meter 12 pack EACH 10 no bid 186.87        56.00          90.00         56.00        

67 Fiber Pigtail multi mode LC/APC multicolor 3 meter 6 pack EACH 10 no bid 116.58        50.00          45.00         45.00        

68 Fiber Pigtail multi mode LC/APC multicolor 3 meter 12 pack EACH 10 no bid 166.43        99.00          80.00         80.00        

69 Corning Freedom Indoor/Outdoor 12 str SM + 6 str MM OM3 fiber FOOT 7,000 no bid 2.39            1.70            no bid 1.70          

70 Corning Freedom Indoor/Outdoor Shielded 12 str SM + 6 str MM OM3 fiber FOOT No estimate no bid no bid 4.20            no bid 4.20          

71 Corning Freedom Indoor/Outdoor 12 str SM fiber FOOT No estimate no bid no bid 0.65            no bid 0.65          

72 Telephone Tie Cable Cat 3 Indoor 25 Pair - Shielded - CMR FOOT No estimate no bid no bid 0.875          0.675         0.68          

73 Telephone Tie Cable Cat 3 Indoor 25 Pair - CMP FOOT No estimate no bid no bid 0.62            0.963         0.62          

74 Telephone Tie Cable Cat 3 Indoor 50 Pair - Shielded - CMR FOOT 1000 no bid no bid 1.50            1.60           1.50          

75 Telephone Tie Cable Cat 3 Indoor 50 Pair - CMP FOOT 1000 no bid no bid 1.50            1.86           1.50          

76 Telephone Tie Cable Cat 3 Indoor 100 Pair - Shielded - CMR FOOT No estimate no bid no bid 2.95            3.12           2.95          

77 Telephone Tie Cable Cat 3 Indoor 100 Pair - CMP FOOT No estimate no bid no bid 2.35            3.69           2.35          

78 Telephone Outdoor Cat 3 25 Pair, 24 gauge, aircore (PE-22) FOOT No estimate no bid no bid 0.82            1.17           0.82          

79 Telephone Outdoor Cat 3 50 Pair, 24 gauge, aircore (PE-22) FOOT No estimate no bid no bid 1.45            2.07           1.45          

80 Telephone Outdoor Cat 3 100 Pair, 24 gauge, aircore (PE-22) FOOT No estimate no bid no bid 2.66            3.81           2.66          

81 Telephone Outdoor Cat 3 25 Pair gauge, direct bury gel filled (PE-89) FOOT No estimate no bid no bid 0.80            1.12           0.80          

82 Telephone Outdoor Cat 3 50 Pair gauge, direct bury gel filled (PE-89) FOOT No estimate no bid no bid 1.80            2.02           1.80          

83 Telephone Outdoor Cat 3 100 Pair gauge, direct bury gel filled (PE-89) FOOT No estimate no bid no bid 2.15            3.76           2.15          

84 TV Cable RG6 Plenum FOOT No estimate no bid no bid 0.305          0.40           0.31          

85 TE Wiring Block with Mounting Legs - 100-Pair EACH 558842-1 No estimate no bid 15.00          11.65          11.80         11.65        

86 TE Connecting Blocks - 110 - 5 Pair EACH 558402-1 No estimate no bid 0.79            0.60            0.60           0.60          TIE

87 TE 110 Connect Kits – 5 Pair Connecting Blocks – 100 Pair EACH 569440-1 No estimate no bid 32.15          25.20          25.25         25.20        

88 B-Line Cable Connector Assembly - 50 to a box EACH WB4CA 500 no bid 0.93            0.90            1.74           0.90          

89 B-Line Drop Out 8” EACH WB08DO No estimate no bid no bid 2.50            4.68           2.50          

90 B-Line Drop Out 12” EACH WB12DO No estimate no bid no bid 2.50            4.68           2.50          

91 B-Line Hooks with Mount Bracket BCH32-RB EACH BCH32-RB No estimate 5.14         4.97            3.20            3.96           3.20          

92 B-Line Hooks BCH32 EACH BCH32 100 3.36         2.83            1.95            3.03           1.95          

93 B-Line Hooks EACH BCH64-RB No estimate 7.84         8.20            2.90            6.38           2.90          

94 B-Line Hold Down Plate – hole size .4”X.7” EACH WB6CH 200 no bid 1.39            0.72            1.27           0.72          

95 Flex Tray Cable Tray 2X8X10 EACH FT2x8x10 No estimate no bid 64.57          50.00          94.41         50.00        

96 Flex Tray Cable Tray 4X8X10 EACH FT4x8x10 20 no bid 57.26          52.00          99.34         52.00        

97 Flex Tray Cable Tray 4X12X10 EACH FT4X12X10 No estimate no bid no bid 61.00          113.43       61.00        

98 Flex Tray Cable Tray 2X12X10 EACH FT2X12X10 No estimate no bid 68.43          58.00          100.05       58.00        

99 Flex Tray Cable Tray 4X4X10 EACH FT4X4X10 20 no bid 54.01          52.00          93.70         52.00        

100 Flex Tray Cable Tray 2X4X10 EACH FT2X4X10 10 no bid 51.17          50.00          88.77         50.00        

101 STI Firestop Pillow 1"x4"x9" EACH SSB14 No estimate 9.33         11.80          8.04            8.68           8.04          

102 STI Firestop Pillow 2"x6"x9" EACH SSB26 No estimate 13.05       16.51          11.20          12.11         11.20        

103 Quazite Underground Pullbox EACH PG2436BA18 No estimate no bid no bid 405.00        no bid 405.00      

104 Quazite Underground Pullbox Cover EACH PG2436CA0012 No estimate no bid no bid 265.00        no bid 265.00      

105 Quazite Underground Pullbox Extension EACH PG2436EA08 No estimate no bid no bid 240.00        no bid 240.00      
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