
BID TABULATION

Bid #:  IFB13-2624T



Due Date: February 1, 2013


Agency:  Department of Corrections


Contracts Officer:  Tia Snyder

Item:  Group 1-Probation and Parole Ammunition
	Vendor
	Brand/Model
	Unit Price
	Extension Price for Units
	Comments

	Adamson Police Products
	Line1-Speer Lawman Training 53652 or Equal
	No Bid
	No Bid
	

	
	Line 2-Speer Gold Dot-No Substitutions
	No Bid
	No Bid
	

	
	Line 3-Brass Return (Credit off Invoice)
	No Bid
	No Bid
	

	
	Line 4-Misc. Ammunition Return (Credit off Invoice)
	No Bid
	No Bid
	

	Total Bid Group 1
	No Bid
	

	

	Ultramax Ammunition
	Line1-Speer Lawman Training 53652 or Equal
	$0.216
	$22,032.00
	Delivery date this line 180 days

	
	Line 2-Speer Gold Dot-No Substitutions
	$0.31
	$2,552.00
	Delivery date this line 180 days

	
	Line 3-Brass Return (Credit off Invoice)
	
	-$1,100.00
	Delivery date this line N/A

	
	Line 4-Misc. Ammunition Return (Credit off Invoice)
	
	-$1,350.00
	Delivery date this line N/A

	Total Bid Group 1
	$22,134.00
	


Item:  Group 2-Montana State Prison Ammunition

	Vendor
	Brand/Model
	Unit Price
	Extension Price for Units
	Comments

	Adamson Police Products
	 Line 5-Winchester Premium Tactical 357-IN or Equal
	$352.70 per 1,000 rounds
	$5,643.20
	Delivery date this line 180 days

	
	Line 6-Winchester Premium Tactical XB121 or Equal
	$591.60 per 1,000 rounds
	$2,958.00
	Delivery date this line 180 days

	Total Bid Group 2
	$8,601.20
	

	

	Ultramax Ammunition
	Line 5-Winchester Premium Tactical 357-IN or Equal
	$0.339
	$5,424.00
	Delivery date this line 90 days

	
	Line 6-Winchester Premium Tactical XB121 or Equal
	$0.736
	$3,680.00
	Delivery date this line at once

	Total Bid Group 2
	$9,104.00
	


PAGE  
Page 1 of 1
S:\Forms\bidtab.doc

New 3/01


